April 12, 2022

CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS 
                                            April 12, 2022

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on Tuesday, April 12, 2022 at 10:00 a.m. in the Commissioner Room of the Clark County Courthouse. Chairman Knock called the meeting to order at 10:00 a.m. Commissioners present in the Courthouse:  Wallace Knock, Francis Hass, Richard Reints, Terry Schlagel and Chris Sass. Also present Auditor Tarbox. 

COMMUNITY COMMENTS: Andrew Zemlicka representing the City of Clark met with the board to discuss complaints of city police going out of their jurisdiction.  He was questioning if County officials had received similar complaints. The board discussed concerns regarding the complaint. EM Lewis and Sheriff McGraw offered comments.  

AGENDA: Motion by Schlagel, second by Hass to approve the agenda for, April 12, 2022. All voting aye. Motion carried.

[bookmark: _Hlk89939670]MINUTES: Motion by Reints, second by Sass, to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of March 15, 2022. All voting aye: Motion carried.

HIGHWAY: HS Eggleston met with the board to update them on road conditions and work being done. Discussion was held regarding damage to County Road 17. Discussion will take place with Riverview regarding damage and road haul agreement and who covers costs.

FUEL QUOTES: The following fuel quotes were presented to the board for April 2022. Diesel #2: Agwrx – 4.05, This bid was received on April 4, 2022 and good for one week. Clark Community Oil 4.419, bid good for one month. Vollan Oil – No bid. Gas E-10: Agwrx – no bid. Clark Community Oil-No bid. Vollan Oil – No bid. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.    

CCR: Chad Smidt unavailable moved this agenda item to April 19, 2022 meeting. 

BUNKHOUSES: Joe Waldner and Kent Namkin from Mayfield Truss met with the board to discuss the possibility of building bunkhouse units on private property. The units are needed to house incoming laborers for the Truss plant. The board informed them they will check with Planning and Zoning officials and discuss it further on April 19, 2022.

CORRESPONDENCE: Auditor Tarbox informed the board that SA Fjelland had filed for party status with the Public Utilities Commission in the matter of the Carbon Dioxide pipeline. 

CONSERVATION DISTRICT: Motion by Schlagel, second by Sass to acknowledge Clark County Conservation District annual report and allow publication. All voting aye. Motion carried.  The report is on file in the Auditor office. 

ARPA FUNDS: Motion by Schlagel, second by Reints to allow Christine Tarbox, County Auditor, to elect the final rule allowing counties to use up to $10 million of the ARPA Recovery Funds as “loss revenue” for the provision of the general government services without needing to use the T
reasury revenue loss formula.  The County has elected to use salaries and County paid benefits from the General Fund as an expense of the American Rescue Plan in the amount up to $10 million to be reimbursed quarterly. All voting aye. Motion carried. 

SHERIFF: Motion by Schlagel, second by Reints to approve pay increase for Sheriff Deputy Stiefel as she has completed the 6 month probation period. Her salary will increase to $42,500 and will be effective April 3, 2022. All voting aye. Motion carried.

HOLIDAYS: Auditor Tarbox informed the board that Governor Noem declared Easter Monday as administrative leave. The Courthouse will be closed on Easter Monday, April 19, 2022. Juneteenth has been declared a federal holiday and will be recognized on Monday, June 20, 2022.

HOSPITALIZATION: Welfare Director Tarbox presented notifications of hospitalization. 

GARAGE: The board discussed the possibility of purchasing a garage to house County vehicles. Further discussion will continue at the April 19, 2022 meeting. 

DENIAL: Motion by Sass, second by Hass to deny an application for poor relief assistance from Avera Heart Hospital of Sioux Falls in the amount of $20,870.52 for county resident as per request of WD Tarbox. The County is unable to determine if resident is a medically indigent person, as that term is defined in SDCL 28-13-1,3 or whether resident qualifies for county poor relief under SDCL 28-13. No documentation supporting that the resident is a medical indigent person has been provided to the County. An application was mailed to the resident on January 3, 2022 and not returned. All voting aye. Motion carried.   

RESOLUTION 11-22: Motion by Reints, second by Schlagel to approve Bryant Booster Site Addition Plat. All voting aye. Motion carried.  

RESOLUTION 11-22
“BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Clark County, South Dakota, that the plat entitled: “Bryant Booster Site Addition Located in the Northeast Quarter of Section 20, Township 113 North, Range 56 West of the 5th P.M., Clark County, South Dakota”, which has been submitted for examination pursuant to law, and it appearing that all taxes and special assessments have been paid and that such plat and the survey thereof have been made and executed according to law, that plat is hereby approved, and the County Auditor is hereby authorized and directed to endorse on such plat a copy of this Resolution and certify the same.

Dated this 12th day of April, 2022. 

/s/ Wallace Knock____________________
Chairman, Board of County Commissioners
Clark County, South Dakota 
ATTEST:     
/s/ Christine Tarbox_________
County Auditor 
Clark County, South Dakota

CLAIMS: Motion by Sass, second by Reints to approve the following claims and allow the auditor to issue payments for same. All voting aye. Motion carried. COMMISSIONERS: Clark Co Courier – proceedings 641.10, Plymouth UCC- Sioux Valley Commissioner meeting 732.00, US Bank Voyager – gas 92.31, ELECTIONS: Ken’s Fairway – supplies 5.43, McLeods-primary election supplies 725.67, AUDITOR: Connecting Point – splash top renewal – 232.00, ITC-service 66.88, Office Peeps – ink stamp pad 239.18, Plymouth UCC- Sioux Valley Commissioner meeting 24.00, PMB-0112 user/access fees -78.75, Wageworks – cobra costs 12.90, TREASURER: Clark Co Courier – redeem tax sales notice 38.17, ITC-service 51.62, Office Peeps – cartridges/binder – 391.28, Plymouth UCC – Sioux Valley District meeting – 24.00, STATES ATTORNEY: ITC – service 49.08, SD Dept of Revenue – blood draw 120.00, Thomson Reuters- West Publishing – online library – 415.01, COURT: Bratland Law – court appt atty – 1590.20, PUBLIC BUILDINGS: City of Clark -water 88.05, Clark Ace Hardware -supplies 119.02, Cook’s Wastepaper- garbage 37.00, Culligan – water 109.00, Eastside Equipment – bolts 27.18, ITC-service 77.70, JCL Solutions – Janitors Closet – supplies 157.65, Star Laundry -rugs 71.82, Sturdevants Auto Parts – supplies 139.99, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: Clark Co Courier- equalization board, tax exempt 209.28, ITC-service 75.41, REGISTER OF DEEDS: ITC-service 87.73, Plymouth UCC-Sioux Valley comm meeting – 12.00, Toshiba Financial Services – copy machine rent 109.02, VETERANS OFFICER: ITC-service 46.34, SHERIFF: AT&T Mobility – service 256.31, Clark Ace Hardware – supplies 22.98, Clark CO Treasurer—title transfer fees 20.00, Clark Community Oil – fuel 962.09, ITC-service 191.02, Mack’s -oil change 59.95, US Bank Voyager Fleet System -gas 259.54, WW Tire Service -flat repair 27.00, PRISONER CARE: Codington Co Auditor – prisoner care 2060.00, AIRPORT: Clark Rural Water -water 35.00, NURSE: Plymouth UCC – Sioux Valley Comm meeting 12.00, SD Dept of Health- 1st/2nd qtr nurse  2232.50, AMBULANCE: A-Ox Welding- oxygen 51.24, AT&T Mobility-service 223.08, John Birnell – recertification fee 25.00, Bound Tree Medical-supplies 381.88, City of Clark – water – 77.65, Clark Ace Hardware-supplies 36.57, Clark Community Oil – gas 622.33, Employer Reemployment – 1st qtr unemployment 570.65, ITC-service 187.45, J&J Heating & Air Conditioning –install motor 570.14, Ken’s Fairway-supplies 91.87, Lewis Family Drug-supplies - 855.00, Northwestern Energy - utilities 655.70, Star Laundry -  laundry 15.36, Two Way Solutions – pyramid/mobile cable 450.40, US Bank Voyager – gas 78.35, SOC SERV FOR AGED: Inter Lakes Comm Action – support serv work/April 1508.00, MENTAL HEALTH CENTER :  Human Service Agency-2nd qrt appropriations 3451.25, EXHIBITION BUILDING:  – Clark Co 4-H Leaders yearly donation 5,000.00, EXTENSION: ITC-service 139.32, Ken’s Fairway – supplies 21.94, Office Peeps -battery 13.05, Plymouth UCC- Sioux Valley mtg 12.00, SDAE4-HP-spring conference 32.50, Star Laundry & Dry Cleaners - rugs 43.86, WEED: City of Clark -water 56.85, Clark Co Courier – annual weed board mtg 75.00, Cook’s Wastepaper -garbage 49.53, Employer Reemployment -1st qtr unemployment – 380.43, ITC-service  105.90, NASASP – dues 39.00, ROAD & BRIDGE: Aramark -towels 243.83, AT&T Mobility -service 54.38, Bierschbach Equipment – parts/cold mix 1702.56, Boyer Ford Trucks-parts 122.17, Butler Machinery-parts 7.50, City of Clark -water 72.45, Clark Ace Hardware – supplies 236.32, Clark Co Courier-classified ad-258.25, Cook’s Wastepaper-garbage 49.54, Employer Reemployment -1wt qrt unemployment 951.10, Glacial Lakes Radiator – parts 1500.00, I-State Truck Center – parts 2457.83, Inland Truck Parts-parts 110.22, ITC-service 169.87, J&L Machine and Welding – outside repair 4561.85, Little Falls Machine – parts 321.94, Menards -supplies 98.81, Northwestern Energy-utilities 594.34, Office Peeps – supplies 30.95, Plymouth UCC – Sioux Valley mtg 12.00, RDO Equipment – bulk oil 2270.70, Saber Shred Solutions – scrap tires 493.20, Sioux Rural Water System – water 50,00, Sturdevants Auto Parts-filters/supplies 2533.15, Westside Implement – parts 348.71, Wheelco – parts 5619.45, 911 SERVICE: ITC-service 145.23, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility -service 45.23, ITC-service 49.30, Plymouth UCC- Sioux Valley meeting 12.00, Sturdevants Auto Parts – supplies 16.85, US Bank Voyager Fleet Systems – gas 110.80, PRISONER CARE: Byron Nogelmeier-remote/ fees for 24/7-1357.00, REGISTER OF DEEDS: Microfilm Imaging Systems – software 250.00,  M&P RELIEF FLOW THRU: SDACO -fee – 194.00, TOTAL: 55,908.00. 

PAYROLL: COMMISSIONERS: 6551.28, AUDITOR: 4052.65, TREASURER: 4423.54, STATES ATTORNEY: 3086.24, COURTHOUSE: 2027.60, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 4773.93, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 3708.83, VETERANS OFFICER: 389.65, SHERIFF: 7585.05, POOR: 967.27, NURSE: 2,203.12, AMBULANCE: 12,427.34, EXTENSION: 937.70, WEED: 312.56, PLANNING & ZONING: 325.30, ROAD & BRIDGE: 38,278.15, EMERGENCY & DISASTER: 1241.05. TOTAL: 93,291.26.

ADJOURN:  Motion by Hass, second by Schlagel to adjourn at 1:56 p.m. until next regular meeting Tuesday, April 19, 2022 following Equalization meeting at approximately 8:30 a.m. All voting aye. Motion carried. 

 ATTEST:     
 (SEAL)

__________________________      	 	 _________________________                            
Christine Tarbox 			       	Wallace Knock, Chairman
Clark County Auditor			       	Clark County Board of Commissioners
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