March 1, 2022

CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS 
                                            March 1, 2022

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on Tuesday, March 1, 2022 at 8:00 a.m. in the Commissioner Room of the Clark County Courthouse. Vice -Chairman Sass called the meeting to order at 8:00 a.m. Chairman Knock present via teleconference. Commissioners present in the Courthouse:  Francis Hass, Richard Reints, Terry Schlagel and Chris Sass. Also present Auditor Tarbox. 

COMMUNITY COMMENTS: None 

AGENDA: Motion by Schlagel, second by Reints to approve the agenda for March 1, 2022. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried.

[bookmark: _Hlk89939670]MINUTES: Motion by Hass, second by Knock, to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of February 15, 2022. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried.

HIGHWAY: HS Eggleston met with the board to update them on road conditions and work being done.  He informed them the County has been approved for grant dollars for bridge #13-023-230 in Clark County.

HIGHWAY: Motion by Reints, second by Sass to declare a 2018 Vermeer M7040 Disc Mower as surplus and set to sell at public auction at the Courthouse on Thursday, May 7, 2022 at 9:00 am. during regular scheduled commission meeting. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried.

HIGHWAY: Motion by Knock, second by Reints to declare a 2019 Vermeer M7040 disc mower as surplus and set to sell at public auction at the Courthouse on Thursday, May 7, 2022 at 9:00 a.m. during regular scheduled commissioner meeting. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried. 

HIGHWAY: Motion by Hass, second by Sass to approve Beadle County bid from True North Steel for culverts for 2022. All bids are on file and available for public inspection in the Auditor’s office. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried.

FUEL QUOTES: The following fuel quotes were presented to the board for March 2022. Diesel #1: Agwrx – No bid, Clark Community Oil 3.698, Vollan Oil – 3.625. Diesel #2: Agwrx, No bid., Clark Community Oil- 3.506, Vollan Oil – 3.469, Gas E-10: Agwrx – no bid. Clark Community Oil-3.339. Vollan Oil – 3.37. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.    

TIF: Toby Morris met with the board via teleconference to discuss financial structure, project costs and how much road can be fixed with the funds that are available. They discussed engineering costs and increased costs with inflation rates. Marshall Edelman was in attendance and asked that the board work with Washington Township and Willow Lake School board with further discussions regarding a TIF in Washington Township. 

[bookmark: _Hlk97216819]WEED:  Weed Supervisor Jenkins met with the board to open 2022 yearly weed bids. Bids are listed below.  
	Nutrien Solutions: 
		Tordon 22K – Corteva  $46.90/gal 2.5 gal container
			                           $46.90/gal 30 gallon drum
		Low Vol 4# Ester –       $31.40/gal 2.5 gal container
			                           $31.40/ gal -30 gallon drum
				               $31.40/gal – 250 gallon tote
		Milestone – $270.00/gal 2.5 gal container
			         67.50 per quart
		2–4-D Amine Herbicide- $23.50/gal 2.5 gal container
			                             $23.50/ gal –30 gallon drum	
					     $23.50/gal – 265 Gal tote
		4-A Freelex Herbicide - $25.50/gal – 2.5 gal container
					    $25.50/gal – 30 gal drum
					    $25.50/gal 250 gal tote
		Rodeo Herbicide – $43.40/gal -2.5 gal cont
		Arsenal Herbicide – $62.50/gal -2.5 gal cont 
		Method 240 SL Herbicide - $322.56 - 2.5 gal cont
		Grazon Next HL Herbicide - $45.40/gal – 2.gal cont
		Grazon P+D Herbicide   $29.90/gal -2.5 gal cont
		Bisect L Insecticide - $48.00/gal – 1 gal cont
	CROP OIL: 
Maximizer Crop Oil - $11.40/gal – 2.5 gal cont
		Spreader 90 Surfactant $16.90/gal – 2.5 gal cont
		90/10 Surfactant - $9.40/gal – 2.5 gal cont
		Liberate Surfactant - $26.00/gal – 2.5 gal cont
		LI Surfactant 700 - $25.00/gal – 2.5 gal container
		MSO Surfactant $14.30/gal 2.5 gal container
		Choice Weather Master - $16.00/gal- 2.5 gal container
	`	Weather Guard Complete $39.00/gal 2.5 gal container 
		Reign Drift Control RTU $17.00/gal, 2.5 gal container
		Clash Herbicide $44.50/gal – 2.5 gal container
		MasterLine Kontrol 4-4 Insecticide - $32.00/gal-2.5 gal container
VanDiest Supply 
		Tordon 22K – Corteva - $47.49/gal 2.5 gal container
		2-4D Ester- Cornbelt -    No bid.
		Milestone-$270.00/gal 2.5/gal container or $67.50/qt
		2-4D Amine –SUB Hi Dep - $21.45/gal 2.5 gal container
		Imitator Aquatic -Generic - $48.35/gal 2.5 gal container
		Arsenal -$50.00/gal - 2.5 gal container
		Freelex – Choline 2,4-0 $25.50/gal 2.5 gal containers
		Method 240 SL - $322.56/gal 2.5 gal container
		Piper – $4.38/oz -60 oz container
		Premier 90 NIS – 23.43/gal 2.5 gallon container
		Avalon - 38.73/gal
		Evoluer 4-4 $24.15/gal
		2-4D Amine 4 lb – No bid
		Dicamba HD  - No bid
		Crop Oil 17% - $9.68/gl
		Sunwet MSO – Methylated seed oil - $10.05/gas
Gardian-Drift retardant- $20.52
		Grazon Next HL – $49.15/gal
	Agrasyst
		Agrasyst -Oveum Plus $26.00/gal – with water conditioner
		Agrasyst 90 (90/10) $19.00/gal 
		Agrasyst Maxso (MSO) $22.00/gal
		Agrasyst – Lodrift 90 $21.00/gal
		Agrasyst Full load $27.24/gal – water conditioner
Agrasyst – Drift - $29.50/gal -drift agent

WEED: Motion by Schlagel, second by Reints to accept all bids based on lowest price and availability.  Voting aye Hass, Knock, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried.

ANNUAL REPORT: Motion by Reints, second by Schlagel to approve the 2021 annual report as presented by the County Auditor and allow publication. Voting aye: Knock, Hass, Reints, Schlagel and Sass. Motion carried. 
 
NOTIFICATIONS: WD Tarbox presented a notification of hospitalization.

DOE: Doe Reidburn met with the board at the request of Commissioner Schlagel to discuss availability of the parcel software to board members. It was discussed and decided board members will receive the service with no fee.  

CRP: The board discussed options for the Clark County CRP acres that will expire this year. Discussion with the FSA office indicated further information will be available after April 1. Decision that will be made after additional information is received.

CLAIMS: Motion by Knock, second by Hass to approve the following claims and allow the auditor to issue payments for same. All voting aye. Motion carried. COMMISSIONERS: Clark Co Courier – proceedings 282.57, SDACC – 2022 annual dues 1076.00, Tony’s Collision -2009 Dodge Durango oil change/wipers-106.53, ELECTIONS: Clark Co Courier- publication 52.23, AUDITOR: Clark Co Treasurer-postage 78.00, Connecting Point – antivirus renewal 85.00, Office Peeps- labels/stapler/staples 89.32, PMB-0112 – user fees-152.00, TREASURER: Clark Co Treasurer- postage 174.00, Office Peeps- thermal roll/ toner 145.16, PUBLIC BUILDINGS: Culligan -water 95.25, Dollar General – Lysol 46.99, DVL Fire & Safety – annual inspection 91.00, JCL Solutions-Janitors Closet -supplies 32.55, Mid-American Research -water treatment 359.04, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: Office Peeps-pens 20.76, SHERIFF: AT&T Mobility – service 256.31, Clark County Treasurer – postage 64.30, National Sheriff’s Assn – 2022 dues 71.00, Office Peeps- ink 8.39, SD Dept of Public Safety – teletype service Jan-June 2022 – 2730.00, POOR: SDACC – catastrophic poor – 782.00, AMBULANCE: AAA Collections – collections 112.50, AT&T Mobility -service 226.47, Clark Co Treasurer – postage 78.00, JCL Solutions- Janitor’s Closet – supplies 32.55, Office Peeps- cartridge 132.57, EXTENSION: Kim McGraw – supplies 44.95, WEED: Clark Co Courier- call for bids 68.30, DVL Fire & Safety – annual inspection – 162.00, PLANNING & ZONING: Clark Co Courier- CU request 26.41, ROAD & BRIDGE: AT&T Mobility – service 53.39, Clark Co Courier – help wanted 148.50, DVL Fire & Safety – annual inspection – 1970.81, Northwestern Energy – utilities 167.56, Safety Service – parts 1594.45, Sioux Rural Water – water 50.00, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility – service 45.23, M&P RELIEF FLOW THRU: SDACO -fee – 128.00, TOTAL: 11,840.09. 

PAYROLL: COMMISSIONERS: 6482.81, AUDITOR: 4058.99, TREASURER: 4423.56, STATES ATTORNEY: 3086.26, COURTHOUSE: 2027.59, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 4752.43, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 3499.48, VETERANS OFFICER: 389.65, SHERIFF: 7585.02, NURSE: 2,203.12, AMBULANCE: 13,290.70, EXTENSION: 937.71, WEED: 1558.03, PLANNING & ZONING: 325.30, ROAD & BRIDGE: 33,961.96, EMERGENCY & DISASTER: 1067.69. TOTAL: 89,650.30.

ADJOURN:  Motion by Hass, second by Schlagel to adjourn at 10:26 a.m. until next regular meeting Tuesday, March 15, 2022 at 8:00 a.m. Members present voting aye. Motion carried. 
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