
CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS

September 3, 2013

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on September 3, 2013 in the Commissioners’ meeting room of the Clark County Courthouse.  Chairman Hass called the meeting to order at 8:00 a.m. with the following Commissioners present: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks and Loomis. Also present Auditor Tarbox and Robert Saur.
 MINUTES: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke, to approve the minutes from the August 20, 2013 regular meeting. All members voting aye.  Motion carried.

REIMBURSEMENT: Nurse Secretary Helkenn met with the board to ask for reimbursement for her meals for training she attended in Watertown. The training was related to Womens, Infant and Children's program (WIC) and all expenses will be reimbursed to Clark County, therefore she will be reimbursed cost of her meals for this training session. 

 HIGHWAY: HS Eggleston met with the board to discuss highway conditions and road work being done, including roads being oiled, paint stripping and placing and replacing signs. HS Eggleston also informed the board he will be traveling to Rapid City for meetings October 23 and 24, 2013. 
 FUEL QUOTES: The following quotes were presented to the Board. Diesel #2: Clark Community Oil- $3.43, Bradley, Garden City, Vienna and Willow Lake and Clark Shops. Raymond shop no bid. Clark County Farmers Elevator- Diesel #2:  $3.52- Bradley, Garden City, Vienna, Willow Lake and Clark. Raymond shop-no bid.  Wegman Oil: Raymond shop only 3.45. Gasoline: Clark Community Oil 3.535- Clark Shop. Clark County Farmers Elevator-no bid. Wegman Oil - no bid.  The County accepted the low bids and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.
 OPERATING TRANSFER: Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to do operating transfer from General fund to Highway fund in the amount of $500,000.00.Motion carried with all voting aye.
 
AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke to approve auto supplement of $34,466.00 for Highway Department for funds received from Federal funds for ER projects for calendar year 2012. All voting aye. Motion carried.

 BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT: Motion by Wicks, second by Reints to enter into Board of Adjustment. All voting aye. Motion  carried.

 CONDITIONAL USE:  Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks to approve Conditional use permit 11-13 which will allow Drew  Edleman to use SW ¼ 8-113-56 for an extended home  occupation to trade and sell firearms to the general public.  No one appeared. Motion carried with all voting aye. 

 ADJOURN: Motion by Reints, second by Bjerke to adjourn from Board of Adjustment and return to Board of County Commissioners. All voting aye. Motion carried.
 
AMBULANCE: Ambulance Administrator Grensberg met with the board to inform them that Clark County’s hardship request has been granted until August 26, 2014.

 AMBULANCE: Ambulance Admin Grensberg informed the board that Kara Fonken, R.N, and Michelle O’Hara, EVOC need to be added to covered employees for the ambulance roster.

 EXECUTIVE SESSION: Motion by Reints, second by Wicks to enter into executive session at  9:24 a.m. to discuss  personnel issues. All ayes. Motion carried. Chairman Hass declared out of executive session at 9:37 a.m.

AIR CONDITIONER: Custodian Elsen met with the Board to inform them that air conditioner technicians had come to check on the unit and will send a report of the findings when complete.
 
PROVISIONAL BUDGET: Budget hearings were held at 10:00 a.m. No one appeared. The final adoption of the 2013 budget is scheduled for September 19, 2013.
 
EMERGENCY MANAGER: EM Gravning updated the board on disaster declarations, available grants and the mitigation update. He also informed the commissioners of the NIMS training ICS course that need to be completed. He reminded the board of training in Oacoma for himself and Deputy Smith September 9,10 and 11, 2013.

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT: Motion by Loomis, second by Reints to authorize Chairman to sign the Emergency Management State and Local Agreement contract addendum awarding Clark County $13413.88 to be used FFY 2013 (October 1, 2012 through September 31, 2013). All voting aye. Motion carried. 


 LEASE: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to authorize Chairman to sign lease for Jen Severson and Ray Hirte for event at the Fairgrounds on September 14-15, 2013. All voting aye. Motion carried.

 AIRPORT: Auditor Tarbox informed the board that the Airport project will not take place this year as the bid that was received was above the federally appropriated  funds. The project will be rebid in 2014. No action needed.


 RETIREMENT: Auditor Tarbox presented information to the commissioners regarding retirement benefits employees receive and how it affects retired/rehired employees.


 SAGE REQUEST: DOE Paulson met with the board to inform them that the Office of Hearing Examiners has still not made a decision regarding request. No action taken.


 CLAIMS:  Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to approve the following claims and authorize auditor to issue payment for same. All members voting aye. Motion carried. COMMISSIONERS: Clark Co Courier- proceedings/budget-681.75,  JUDICIAL: West Payment Center-SD Court rules 123.00,AUDITOR:  AT&T Mobility-service12.87, ITC-service 32.64, Office  Peeps: desk calendars 123.55, TREASURER: ITC-service 39.34, Office Peeps-desk calendars 37.33, STATES ATTORNEY:  ITC-service 53.76, SD Dept of Rev-blood alcohol 35.00, West  Payment Center-SD Court Rules 123.00, PUBLIC BUILDINGS:  Culligan-water 38.25, ITC-service 38.26, Star Laundry-rugs  48.12, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: ITC-service 80.75, Office Peeps-desk pad 5.41, REGISTER OF DEEDS: A&B  Business-lease contract 227.37, ITC-service 31.39, McLeods-MTS/deed record books 314.85, VETERAN OFFICER: Bruce  Brekke-meals 54.26, ITC-service 32.01, SHERIFF: AT&T  Mobility-service 80.90, Clark Co Courier-school bus safety 157.50,  ITC-service 183.71, AIRPORT: Clark Co Courier-airport bids  139.50, ITC-service cancelled (Refund 24.87), POOR:  ITC-service .16, NURSE: Andrea Helkenn-mileage –WIC training-112.85, AMBULANCE: A-Ox Welding-cylinder  rent-50.22, AT&T Mobility-service 38.61, Chief Supply Corp-batteries 69.35, Clark Co Courier-meeting 30.00, Clark Comm Pharmacy-freestyle lite test strip 120.00, Pam Grensberg-mileage/Huron inservice-44.40, Heiman Fire Equipment – fire extinguisher inspection 20.00,  ITC-service 109.70, MENTAL & HANDICAPPED: SD Dept of Revenue-patient care 60.00, MENTAL ILLNESS BOARD: SD Dept of  Rev-mental illness hearing 106.25, EXTENSION: ITC-service-97.08, Star Laundry-rugs 27.58, US  Postmaster-stamps 214.00, WEED: AT&T Mobility-service 62.13, Clark Co Treas-title/license 2002 Int Navista 10.00,  ITC-service 89.63, Ron’s Small Engine Repair-supplies  16.17, SD Federal Property-2002 Int Truck 12924.25,  PLANNING  & ZONING: Clark Co Courier- CU permits 22.84, ROAD & BRIDGE: AT&T Mobility-service  108.68, Butler  Corp-parts 96.24, Clark Sales-impact wrench 375.00, Diesel  Machinery-parts 138.60, Norlan Froke-CPR training-13.00, ITC-service 158.87, Northern Truck Equipment Corp-parts 121.04, Northwestern Energy-utilities 27.00, Peterbilt of  Sioux Falls-parts 757.29, SDSU-South Dakota LTAP-registration 70.00, Sioux Rural Water System-water 29.00, 911 SERVICE FUND: Milbank Communications-test amb repeater/water tower 600.00, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility-internet cards 242.43, M&P RELIEF FUND: SDACO- ROD fee-244.00. TOTAL: 19876.02.
 
 PAYROLL:  COMMISSIONERS: 6786.89 AUDITOR: 3095.80,  TREASURER: 2983.93, STATES ATTORNEY: 2376.62, COURTHOUSE:  1568.64, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 3038.60, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 2175.41, VETERAN OFFICER: 336.41, SHERIFF: 4559.08, POOR: 453.40, NURSE: 1389.06, AMBULANCE 6257.25, EXTENSION:  1151.19, WEED: 4592.23, PLANNING & ZONING: 396.94, ROAD & BRIDGE: 29730.92, EMERGENCY/DISASTER 842.69, TOTAL:  71735.06.

TAX DEEDS: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to authorize Chairman Hass to execute Deed by County to the following properties, as listed below, that were sold at the tax deed sale August 20, 2013.  All voting aye. Motion carried.
Clark County to Eric Caulfield-Lot 15 Block 4, Original to the Town of Bradley. Consideration amount $800.00. 
Clark County to Eric Caulfield-Lot 11, Block 4, Original to the Town of Bradley. Consideration amount $875.00.
Clark County to Connie Merkel- Lots 13 & 14 Block 4, Harts Addition to the Town of Bradley. Consideration amount $75.00.
Clark County to Cassie Altfillisch E8' of Lot 4 Block 3 Scanlon's Addition to the Town of Bradley. Consideration amount $48.00.
Clark County to Ted Mehlberg - Lots 3 & 4 Block 2 Original to the town of Raymond. Consideration amount $3000.00.
Clark County to Marvin Virchow - Lots 14 & Except SW 18' of Lot 15 Block 2 Johnsons Addition to the Town of Vienna. Consideration amount $150.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop- W 1/2 of Lot 14 & All of Lots 15 & 16, Block 1 Hayward’s Addition to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $100.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop W 25' of Lot 3 All of 4 Block 2 Original to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $300.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop- Lots 12 & 13 & E 1/2 of lot 14 Block 1 Hayward's Addition to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $100.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop- Lot 11 Except E 3' of E 3' of Lot 10 Block 2 Original to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $60.00.
Clark County to Lucas Randall-Lot 7 Block 1 Hayward's Addition to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $100.00
Clark County to Lucas Randall Lot 6 Block 1 Hayward's Addition to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $100.00.
Clark County to Anna Liebke - Lot 8 Co Auditors Plat to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $100.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop-Lots 3 & 4 Block 1 Original to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $1000.00.

Clark County to Farm Country Coop- Lots 5 & 6 Block 1 Original to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $125.00.
Clark County to Farm Country Coop- E3' of Lot 11 & West 22' of Lot 12 Block 2 Original to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $65.00.
Clark County to Jack Hansen, Jr. Lots 5 & 6 Block 3 Baileys Addition to the Town of Garden City. Consideration amount $1250.00.

ADJOURN: Motion by Wicks, second by Reints to adjourn as board of Commissioners until next regular meeting Thursday, September 19, 2013 at 8:00 a.m. All voting aye. Motion carried.

ATTEST    (SEAL)



_____________________________                        ______________________________
Christine Tarbox                                                         Francis Hass, Chairman
Clark County Auditor                                                  Clark County Commissioners
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