
CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS
August 6, 2013

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on August 6, 2013 in the Commissioners’ meeting room of the Clark County Courthouse.  Chairman Hass called the meeting to order at 8:00 a.m. with the following Commissioners present: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks and Loomis. Also present Auditor Tarbox and Robert Saur. 
MINUTES: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis, to approve the minutes from the July 23, 2013 regular meeting. All members voting aye.  Motion carried.
HIGHWAY: HS Eggleston met with the board to discuss highway conditions and road work being done. 
FUEL QUOTES: The following quotes were presented to the Board. Diesel #2: Clark Community Oil- $3.33, Bradley, Garden City, Vienna and Willow Lake Shops. Raymond shop no bid. Clark County Farmers Elevator- No bid.  Wegman Oil 3.34 Raymond shop only. Gasoline: Clark Community Oil 3.49- Clark Shop. Clark County Farmers Elevator-no bid. Wegman Oil - no bid. The County accepted the low bids and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.
TRANSPORT LOAD QUOTES: The following quotes were presented to the Board for transport load diesel #2: Clark Community Oil -3.27, Clark Farmers Elevator –no bid, Wegman Oil-no bid. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor’s office.

CONCERNED CITIZEN: Delmer Stern met with the board regarding planting crops in the right-of-way on county and township roads expressing concern about safety issues. Also present HS Eggleston, SA Fjelland and Sheriff McGraw. SA Fjelland stated letters will go out to citizens who have had a complaint filed against them allowing them time to remove crops if they do not, County will remove crop and collect our costs. 

BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke, to move into Board of Adjustment. All members voting aye. Motion carried.
HEARING: At 9:00 a.m. the time specified, hearing was held for CU 7-13, for Rural Tower Network, LLC. Kirk Johnson with Rural Tower Network appeared. Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to approve Conditional Use 7-13. This CU will allow Rural Tower Network to use NE ¼  33-114-56 to place a 100’ RTK GPS signal tower. All members voting aye. Motion carried. 

HEARING: At 9:00 a.m. the time specified, hearing was held for Conditional Use 8-13 for Rural Tower Network, LLC. Kirk Johnson with Rural Tower Network appeared. Motion by Bjerke, second by Reints to approve Conditional use permit 8-13. Conditional use 8-13 will allow Rural Tower Network to use SW ¼ 11-118-57 to place a 100’ RTK GPS signal tower. All voting aye. Motion carried.

HEARING: At 9:00 a.m. the time specified, hearing was held for Conditional Use 9-13 for Rural Tower Network, LLC. Kirk Johnson with Rural Tower Network appeared. Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to approve Conditional use permit 9-13. Conditional use 9-13 will allow Rural Tower Network to use NE ¼ 12-116-56 to place a 100’ RTK GPS signal tower. All voting aye. Motion carried.

SET HEARING: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to set hearing for Donette Dunlavy for Conditional Use 10-13. This CU if approved will permit applicant to use Lots 4,5,6 & 7 Block 2 Ways Addn Crocker, to place three (3) signs and also place livestock equipment for sale. Hearing set for August 20, 2013 at 9:00 a.m. All voting aye. Motion carried.

ADJOURN: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke, to adjourn from Board of Adjustment and return to Board of County Commissioners. Motion carried with all voting aye.
DOE AUDIT REPORT: DOE Paulson presented to the board the audit report prepared by the Department of Revenue for the Director of Equalization office for calendar year 2012. The report summarizes the sales information available in Clark County. The report is on file in the Auditor’s office. No action needed.
HEARING: At 9:30 a.m. the time specified, hearing was held for CAT group for temporary liquor license for event from 5:00 p.m. September 14, 2013 to 2:00 a.m. September 15, 2013. No one appeared. Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke to approve temporary liquor license. Voting aye: Bjerke, Wicks, Loomis, Hass. Voting nay: Reints.  Motion passed 4 to 1.
SET FEE: Motion by Loomis second by Wicks to set fee of $25.00 for temporary liquor license for September 14- September 15, 2013 event. All members voting aye. Motion carried. 

HEARING: At 9:40 a.m., the time specified, hearing was held for CAT group for temporary malt beverage license for event from 5:00 p.m. September 14, 2013 to 2:00 a.m. September 15, 2013. No one appeared. Motion by Bjerke, second by Wicks, to approve temporary malt beverage license. Voting aye: Bjerke, Wicks, Loomis, Hass.   Voting nay: Reints.   Motion passed 4-1.

SET FEE: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to set fee of $50.00 for the temporary malt beverage license for the September 14-15, 2013 event. Motion carried with all voting aye.
AIR CONDITION UNIT:  Don Roerich had been contacted to meet with the commissioners at 10:00 a.m. regarding the air conditioning unit. Mr. Roerich did not attend the meeting. Custodian Elsen met with the board with recommendation that a service technician and a balance technician be hired at the cost of $1000.00 per person to evaluate the system. The arrangements will be made to have unit checked. Elsen will report back at next meeting. 
NURSE: PHN Kriese met with the Commissioners requesting permission to purchase paint for her office. Commissioners granted her request. Nurse staff will do the painting in the nurse office.

AIRPORT: Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks to authorize Chairman to sign the grant offer for the FY-13 Airport Improvement Program that has been approved for Clark County. Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
AIRPORT: ITC had contacted the County regarding phone line at the Airport and placing fiberoptic lines to it. After discussion with the Department of Aeronautics and Airport Manager Hansen it was decided to disconnect this phone line effective immediately.

WAGE FREEZE: Commissioners discussed Greg Stormo’s request for removing his wage freeze, will leave at current status. No action needed.


WEB SITE: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke to utilize Clark Chamber current website to post agenda’s and minutes when available. All voting aye. Motion carried. Clark Chamber website is clarksd.com. 
AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Reints, second by Wicks to allow auto supplement from 226-0-331.22 to 226-222-428. These funds were received from grant dollars for the internet cards. Motion carried with all members voting aye.

SIOUX VALLEY MEETING: Commissioners were informed of the Sioux Valley Meeting that will be held on August 19, 2013 in Clear Lake. 

MITIGATION MEETINGS: Commissioners were informed of Mitigation meetings that are planned during the month of August.

BUDGET: Commissioners spent time reviewing 2014 budget.
CLAIMS:  Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke to approve the following claims and authorize auditor to issue payment for same. All members voting aye. Motion carried. GENERAL: Medica Ins-refund-46.22, Watertown Fire Department-60% of run 857.65, COMMISSIONERS: Clark Chamber-membership 65.00, Clark Co Courier-proceedings-283.23, Deuel Co Auditor-Sioux Valley meeting- 36.00, JUDICIAL SYSTEM: Yanira Novoa-interpreting service 75.00, AUDITOR: AT&T Mobility-service 12.87, Clark Co Treas-postage 67.86, Deuel Co Auditor-Sioux Valley meeting-9.00, ITC-service 33.82, Office Peeps-paper 43.96, TREASURER: Clark Co Treas-postage 17.10, Connecting Point – computer 1158.00, Deuel Co Auditor-Sioux Valley meeting-9.00, ITC-service 41.15, STATES ATTORNEY: ITC-service-56.18, SD Dept of Rev-blood alcohol 70.00, COURT: Harmelink, Fox & Ravnsborg Law-court appointed-113.00, PUBLIC BUILDINGS: Cook’s Wastepaper-garbage service 25.00, Culligan-water 38.25, Dekker Hardware-supplies 130.86, ITC-service 29.64, Ken’s Fairway-supplies 17.98, Moeller Sheet Metal-labor/supplies 291.80, Star Laundry- rugs 48.12, Verdon Roofing- insulation to roof- 19015.27, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION- A&B Business-address labels-38.99, Clark Co Treas-postage 2.32, ITC-service 139.97, Quill Corp-paper 27.99, REGISTER OF DEEDS: A&B Business-copy machine rent 118.81, Clark Co Treasurer-postage-46.00, Deuel Co Auditor-Sioux Valley mtg-9.00, ITC-service 33.10, Marco Inc-3 months maintenance-40.16, Quill Corp- paper 55.98, VETERANS OFFICER: ITC-service 33.82, SHERIFF: A&B Business-paper 40.99, AT&T Mobility-service 81.21, Clark Co Courier-concealed hand gun seminar- 25.00, ITC-service 207.13, North Dakota Sheriff’s -2013 Fall sheriff’s conference 75.00, State Radio Communications-teletype service-2250.00, Tony’s Collision Center-windshield replaced 490.30, AIRPORT: ITC-service 30.89, Westcoast Sales and Marketing-lens 238.56, POOR: Credit Bureau-collection fees 33.33, AMBULANCE: A-Ox Welding Supply- oxygen/cylinder rent 175.17, AT&T Mobility- service 38.61, Clark Co Treas-postage 46.00, CLIA Lab Program-certificate fee 150.00, Credit Bureau-collection fees-14.33, Dekker Hardware-supplies 16.99, ITC-service 107.48, JB’s Repair-parts/supplies 155.50, Office Peeps-envelopes 84.99, MENTAL & HANDICAPPED: SD Dept of Revenue-patient care 60.00, EXTENSION OFFICE: Clark Co Treas-postage 20.00, Dekker Hardware –supplies 16.99, ITC-service 77.27, Star Laundry & Dry Cleaners-rugs 27.58, WEED: A&B Business-envelopes 13.36, Alligare, LLC-picloram 8530.00, AT&T Mobility- service 62.48, Clark Co Treas-postage 66.60, Cook’s Wastepaper-garbage service 33.87, Dekker Hardware-supplies 56.67, ITC-service 89.58, Personnel Concepts-shipping 5.95, Ron’s Small Engine Repair-carb kit/fuel filter 49.18, Runnings Supply-supplies 313.10, SGS North American-feed/forage testing/analysis 159.00, Sturdevants Auto Parts-supplies 465.81, VanDiest Supply Co-amine 5287.80, Westside Implement-supplies 137.94, PLANNING & ZONING: Clark Co Courier-conditional use permits 33.56, ROAD & BRIDGE: Ameripride Services-towels 65.51, AT&T Mobility-service 108.67, Larry Brannan-mileage 40.70, Butler Corp-parts 163.50, Clark Co Courier-co road closed 30.00, Clark County Treasurer-postage 16.37, Cook’s Wastepaper-garbage service 33.88, Cross Country Vet-mineral oil 56.40, Dekker Hardware-supplies 537.78, Del-Mar Upholstery-recover seat 200.00, Diamond Mowers-parts 205.05, Fastenal Company-parts 180.04, Flint Hills Resources MC 3000-244,354.58, GCR Tire Centers-tires 195.38, ITC-service 111.49, Matt Kadinger-mileage 81.40, James Lewandowski-mileage 53.28, Mac’s Inc-parts 38.64, Macksteel Warehouse-parts 401.62, Matheson Tri-gas-welding supplies 296.28, Northwestern Energy-utilities 17.50, Oscar’s Machine Shop-parts 676.19, Peterbilt of Sioux Falls-parts 93.08, ProBuild-shop supplies 40.91, Sioux Rural Water-water 29.00, Tom Stacey-mileage 88.80, Sturdevants Auto Parts-supplies 2689.99, Titan Machinery-parts 4691.06, Titan Access Account-parts 1677.27, Tony’s Collision-repairs 2341.73 Westside Implement-parts 761.26, Winwater-fabric 2173.00, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility-service 242.43, Clark Co Treasurer- postage 5.79, M&P Relief Flow Thru – South Dakota Assoc of Co Officials-fee/ROD modernization 218.00. TOTAL: 305822.90. 

PAYROLL:  COMMISSIONERS: 6876.63 AUDITOR: 3168.53, TREASURER: 2983.92, STATES ATTORNEY: 2376.61, COURTHOUSE: 1537.42, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 3038.61, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 2175.42, VETERAN OFFICER: 336.41, SHERIFF: 4548.45, POOR: 453.40, NURSE: 1389.06, AMBULANCE 5667.09, EXTENSION: 1321.93, WEED: 5270.76, PLANNING & ZONING: 396.94, ROAD & BRIDGE: 34017.97, EMERGENCY/DISASTER 852.85, TOTAL: 76412.00.
Overtime by department: HIGHWAY:  Brad Furness 22.25, Richard Mills 54.00, Roger Mitchell 23.54, Matt Kadinger-66.74, Terry Wellman-66.74, Chance Burke-70.61,Greg Overby -18.00,  James Lewandowski 63.00, Doug Loomis 111.23, Tom Stacey- 22.25, Greg Stormo – 57.87, David Borns 44.49, Larry Brannan 22.25, Dennis Herman 111.23, Stan Mohr-22.89.
ADJOURN: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis, to adjourn until next regular meeting August 20, 2013 at 8:00 a.m. All ayes. Motion carried.

ATTEST   (SEAL)

____________________________


          ___________________________

Christine Tarbox




          Francis Hass, Chairman

Clark County Auditor




          Clark County Commissioners
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