
CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS
April 2, 2013

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on April 2, 2013in the Commissioners’ meeting room of the Clark County Courthouse.  Chairman Hass called the meeting to order at 8:00 a.m. with the following Commissioners present: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks and Loomis.  Also present Auditor Tarbox.

 

MINUTES: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to approve the minutes from the March 19, 2013 meeting as presented. All members voting aye.  Motion carried. 
 

HIGHWAY: Highway Superintendent Eggleston met with the board to inform them of road conditions, 
other work being done and roads that have gone under water.
FUEL QUOTES: Fuel quotes were received and are noted as follows:  Clark Community Oil,  Diesel #2- 3.37 –Bradley, Garden City, Vienna, Willow Lake. Clark Shop No bid- Raymond Shop: Gas 3.42 – Clark County Farmers Elevator – Diesel #2 3.45 Bradley, Garden City, Vienna and Willow Lake.  Raymond –no bid. Clark –no bid. Wegman Oil- Diesel #2 Raymond shop only 3.40, Gas: Clark Community Oil – Clark Shop 3.47. Clark County Farmers Elevator –No bid, Wegman Oil – no bid. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor’s office.  

TRANSPORT LOAD:  Diesel #2: Clark Community Oil- 3.305, Wegman Oil 3.305. Tie bid: 2nd Bid Community Oil- 3.300, Wegman Oil -3.300, Tie Bid. 3rd Bid: Community Oil 3.299, Wegman Oil 3.295. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor’s office.
CALL FOR BIDS:  Motion by Wicks, second by Reints to call for bids for 1 Current production screening machine. Sealed bids will be accepted at the office of the County Auditor until 8:00 a.m., April 15, 2013. Bids will be opened at 8:00 a.m. on April 15, 2013 and read publicly beginning at 8:00 a.m. on April 16, 2013 at the Clark County Courthouse in the chambers of the Clark County Commissioners Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis.
CALL FOR BIDS: Motion by Bjerke, second by Wicks to call for bids for 1 Current Production Portable Stockpiling Machine. Sealed bids will be accepted at the office of the County Auditor until 8:00 a.m. April 15, 2013. Bids will be opened at 8:00 a.m. on April 15, 2013 and read publicly beginning at 8:00 a.m. on April 16, 2013 at the Clark County Courthouse in the chambers of the Clark County Commissioners. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried.

PURCHASE: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke to approve loan from Dacotah Bank in the amount of $265,000.00 to purchase 1 motorgrader. Persons to sign the note will be Chairman Hass and Auditor Tarbox. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried. 

AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Bjerke, second by Hass to authorize an auto supplement of $161869.02 to Highway gravel account from funds received from STP funds. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried.
AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Reints, second by Bjerke to authorize auto supplement of $44633.07 to Highway gravel account from funds received from 2011 ER Projects. Voting aye; Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis.  Motion carried. 

AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Reints, second by Wicks to authorize auto supplement of 1613.32 to Highway supplies from funds received from insurance proceeds to repair 2010 damaged truck. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried.

AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Bjerke, second by Reints to authorize auto supplement of 5025.60 to Highway heavy equipment from funds received from sale of county property, GMC truck, two pickups and gas pumps. Items were sold at Bell’s Sale March 2013. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried.
AMBULANCE: Ambulance Administrator Grensberg met with the board to discuss the hardship status, hiring additional EMT’s and pay scales. Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks to allow Ambulance Administrator Grensberg to utilize the EMT’s that have finished testing and to increase pay for EMT to $130 for 24 hour shift, $65 for 12 hour shift effective April 3, 2013. Status change and benefit eligibility to be determined. All voting aye. Motion carried.  
SCHEDULE HEARING: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to schedule a public hearing April 16, 2013 at 9:30 for malt beverage application for Clark County Riders for the event that will be held June 21-23, 2013. All members voting aye. Motion carried.
RESOLUTION 12-13: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke to approve Resolution 12-13 that supports efforts to maintain the tax-exempt status of municipal bonds. All members voting aye for the following resolution. Motion carried.
RESOLUTION 12-13

Approved this 2nd day of April, 2013 by Clark County, South Dakota 
Supporting Efforts to Maintain the Tax-Exempt Status of Municipal Bonds.
            WHEREAS, the tax-exempt status of municipal bonds is nearly a century old and is vital to funding local infrastructure and economic development; and
            WHEREAS, of the $1.65 trillion of local infrastructure investment over the last decade using tax-exempt bonds, nearly all of it was in six categories: $514 billion for primary and secondary schools; $288 billion for hospitals; $258 billion for water and sewer facilities; $178 billion for roads, highways and streets; $147 billion for public power projects; and $106 billion for mass transit.
            WHEREAS, any move to change the current tax treatment of local government bonds would lead to higher borrowing costs for local governments; and
            WHEREAS, without tax-exempt financing much-needed infrastructure improvements would likely be delayed; and
            WHEREAS, tax-exempt bonds are a critical tool for South Dakota counties to facilitate budgeting and financing of long-term investments in the infrastructure and facilities necessary to meet public demand for government services; and
            WHEREAS, at a time when infrastructure demands are great, increasing the cost of local government borrowing could have serious impacts on the national, state and local economies; and
            WHEREAS, without the tax-exemption, the effectiveness of the bond market would be significantly dampened, creating higher borrowing costs for county governments, less investment in infrastructure, and fewer jobs. 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that Clark County does hereby support maintaining the current tax-exempt status of municipal bonds.  

Dated at Clark, South Dakota this 2nd day of April, 2013.

ATTEST:
/s/ Christine Tarbox____


/s/ Francis Hass__________
County Auditor



Chairman of the Board of







County Commissioners 

WEED: Motion by Loomis, second by Reints to allow Chairman to sign the State of South Dakota Department of Transportation Joint Powers Agreement for weed spraying services. All members voting aye. Motion carried. A copy of the signed contract is on file in the Auditor’s office.
WEED: Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to allow Weed Supervisor Lynch to set price for chemical sales from his department. All members voting aye. Motion carried.

MALT BEVERAGE HEARING: At 10:00 a.m. the time specified hearing was held for malt beverage and liquor license transfer from Thomas Wheeler to John Bjerke for Rowdy’s Bar in Crocker, SD. John Bjerke appeared. Motion by Bjerke, second by Wicks to approve the transfers. Motion carried with all members voting aye.
DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: As a requirement to SDCL10-3-14, the Director of Equalization met with the County Commissioners and Auditor for conference in reference to the performance of his duties.

ORDINANCE 1-13: At 10:15 the time specified the second reading of Ordinance 1-13 was held. Jeff Olson present. This ordinance will allow for Clark County Farmers Elevator to zone land from agricultural to commercial-industrial at the site west of Clark.  Motion by Reints, second by Wicks to approve Ordinance 1-13. All voting aye. Motion carried. 
NOTICE OF SECOND READING ON PROPOSED CHANGE OF ZONING ORDINANACE OF CLARK COUNTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that the Board of County Commissioners of the Clark County, South Dakota, at a regular meeting held on the 19th of March 2013, held the required public hearing and placed upon its first reading of said Ordinance.






Ordinance 01-13

AN ORDINANCE ENTITLED: an ordinance to amend Article III Second 302 of the Zoning Ordinance of the Clark County

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF THE CLARK COUNTY< SOUTH DAKOTA: that Article III Section 302 of the Zoning Ordinance of the Clark County be amended to classify the following property; Clark County Farmers Elevator Outlot 1 in NW ¼ 12-116-58. Applicant, Clark County Farmers Elevator to Commercial Industrial from Agricultural. 

/s/ Francis Hass, Chairperson


/s/ Christine Tarbox, Auditor 

PLANNING & ZONING: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to enter into Board of Adjustment. Motion carried with all voting aye. Also present ZO Paulson.
CONDITIONAL USE 3-13: At 10:30 a.m. the time specified, a public hearing was held to consider CU 3-13. Also appearing was Jeff Olson. Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke to approve the Conditional use permit 3-13 which will allow Clark County Farmers Elevator to build a fertilizer building on Outlot 1 in NW ¼ 12-116-58. All members voting aye. Motion carried.

CONDITIONAL USE 2-13: At 10:40 a.m. the time specified, a public hearing was held for Conditional Use 2-13 and Variance 2-13 for Silver Lake Colony to place two signs along US Highway 212 in NE ¼ 12-116-57. John Grosz, Jr., and Darrell Seefeldt present. Sheriff McGraw also present and upon his inspection of site for signs he had no issues with sign locations. Action pending. 

CONDITIONAL USE 4-13: At 10:50 a.m. the time specified, a public hearing was held for Conditional Use 4-13 which will allow Steve Weerts to have an extended home occupation stock trailers, horse trailers and enclosed trailers. Appearing Steve and Amy Weerts.  Motion by Loomis, second by Reints to approve Conditional Use 4-13. Motion carried with all members voting aye.





SCHEDULE HEARING: Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks  to schedule hearing for Variance 3-13 for Chris Lamb. Variance will permit the applicant to use the following property SW ¼ 20-115-56 to place bins and support towers closer to the right of way than Clark County zoning permits. Hearing set for April 16, 2013 at 11:00 a.m. All voting aye. Motion carried.

SCHEDULE HEARING: Motion by Wicks, second by Bjerke to schedule hearing for first reading of Ordinance 2-13 for SD Wheat Growers- Carpenter, SD to classify four acres in SE ¼ 33-114-59 to Commercial- industrial from Agricultural. Hearing was set for 11:15 a.m. on April 16, 2013. All members voting aye. Motion carried.
SCHEDULE HEARING: Motion by Reints, second by Wicks to schedule hearing for Variance 4-13 for Michael Borg to use property S243”of N 1083’ of W 596’ of SW ¼ 19-113-56 to place a house closer to the right of way than Clark County zoning permits. All members voting aye. Motion carried.

ADJOURN:  Motion by Reints, second by Bjerke to adjourn from Board of Adjustments and reconvene as Board of Commissioners. Motion carried with all voting aye.

CLARK ENGINEERING: Steve Meyer from Clark Engineering appeared before the board regarding bridge inspection report of bridges in Clark County and bridges that are schedule for repair in the next five years. No action needed.
CLAIMS: Motion by Bjerke, second by Reints to approve the following claims and allow the auditor to authorize payment for same. Voting aye Bjerke, Reints, Wicks, Hass. Abstain: Loomis. Motion carried. GENERAL: Watertown Fire Department -60% of run 507.24, COMMISSIONERS: Best Western –lodging 177.98, Robert Bjerke-gas/meal 52.03, Clark Co Courier-publications 493.54, SDPAA-liability ins 247.00, AUDITOR: Best Western-lodging 88.99, Clark Co Treasurer-postage 46.00, ITC-service 31.03, Office Peeps-supplies 8.57, Chris Tarbox-meal/new officials workshop 12.00, TREASURER: A&B Business-roll/thermal 22.96, Clark Co Courier-redeem certificates 358.72, Clark Co Treasurer-postage-141.25, ITC-service 96.50, Quill Corp- HP Smart print cartridges 149.18, INSURANCE & BONDS: SDPAA-liability ins 29089.63, STATES ATTORNEY: ITC-service 52.73, SD Dept of Rev-blood draw 108.00, PUBLIC BUILDINGS: Culligan-water 42.50, ITC-service 28.20, Star Laundry-rugs 24.06, State Flat Acct-3 flags 46.78, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: Clark Co Courier-tax exempt 191.69, Clark Co Treasurer-postage 2.52, ITC-service-94.84, McLeods –PT-24 forms 226.85, SDAAO-2013 membership dues/registration, annual conference – 155.00, REGISTER OF DEEDS: A&B Business-copy machine rent 114.41, ITC-service- 32.09, VETERANS OFFFICER: ITC-service 31.37, SHERIFF: AT&T Mobility-service 80.50, ITC-service 141.21, SDPAA-liability ins 3441.00, AIRPORT: ITC-service 29.28, POOR: Best Western-lodging 88.99, Jan Brandlee-meal/spring workshop-12.00, ITC-service .53, NURSE: SD Dept of Rev-2nd qrt nurse 1287.50, SDPAA-liability ins 675.00, AMBULANCE: A-OX Welding-oxygen/cylinder rent 162.72, AT&T Mobility-service 51.60, Clark Co Treas-postage 1.23, ITC-service 111.20, JB’s Repair -supplies/repairs 376.50, Joe Schnell-2nd payment/EMT class/books 2540.00, SDPAA-liability ins 4067.00, MENTAL & HANDICAPPED: SD Dept of Rev-patient care 60.00, MENTAL ILLNESS BOARD: Yankton Co Sheriff-civil papers served 25.00, EXTENSION: Clark Co Treas-postage 33.00, ITC-service 135.51, Star Laundry-rugs 13.79, Toshiba Financial –copy machine rent 197.42, WEED: Assn of SD Co W&P Boards-supplies/2013 annual dues-317.50, AT&T Mobility-service 63.30, Clark Co Courier – bids/control weeds 84.07, ITC-service 86.62, Mac’s Inc-parts 51.73, SDPAA-liability ins-1702.00, PLANNING  & ZONING: Clark Co Courier-zoning/variance 60.21, ROAD & BRIDGE- A-Ox Welding-welding supplies 132.84, AT&T Mobility-service 93.32, Butler Corp- parts 1537.13, Clark Co Courier-wt limits/road restriction 105.38, Clark Co Treas-postage 13.80, Clausen Construction-bowes royalties/Feb 316.80, Crocker’s Collision- T-87 repairs/final bill 14318.71, Deadwood Mt Grand-lodging 114.00, ITC-service 97.69, Kuecker Seed Farm-Jan royalties 3477.15, Loretta Larson-Jan-Mar royalties 2225.16, Light & Siren-parts 651.89, Mac’s Inc-parts 178.66, McAsphalt Ind-beram 9254.00, Menard’s –shop supplies 110.59, Northwestern Energy-utilities-187.72, Office Peeps-supplies 120.25, Overhead Door Co-shop repairs/Bradley 55.85, Pheasantland Ind-clothing, 808.94, RDO Equipment-parts 421.84, SDPAA-liability ins-26,749.00, Sioux Rural Water-water-29.00, Titan Access-parts 769.74, Traffic Safety Warehouse-freight on order 57.09, Westside Imp- parts 671.51, 911 SERVICE FUND: Sioux Falls Tower-repair antenna on water tower 8185.00, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility-service 256.48, M&P RELIEF FLOW THRU: SD Assn of Co Officials-fee/rod modernization 240.00. TOTAL: 119.749.61.

PAYROLL:  COMMISSIONERS: 6731.33, AUDITOR: 3168.53, TREASURER: 2983.91, STATES ATTORNEY: 2376.65, COURTHOUSE: 1506.19, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 3125.28, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 2175.43, VETERAN OFFICER: 336.38, SHERIFF: 4563.18, POOR: 453.39, NURSE: 1389.04, AMBULANCE 7558.53, EXTENSION: 1259.26, WEED: 1322.37, PLANNING & ZONING: 396.94, ROAD & BRIDGE: 31067.88, EMERGENCY/DISASTER 848.83, TOTAL: 71263.12.

AIRPORT: Doug Hansen and Chuck Beving met with the Commissioners to inform them that Hansen, Beving and Steve Berg will form an ad-hoc airport committee to assure future planning, operation, security and setting the standards for the Clark County Airport. No action needed.

PLANNING  & ZONING: Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks to reconvene as Board of Adjustment. All members voting aye. Motion carried. Also present States Attorney Fjelland.

CONDITIONAL USE 2-13: Motion by Loomis, second by Wicks to allow Silver Lake Colony to place signs on the property along Highway 212 as allowed by Sect 3.4.01of Clark Zoning.  All voting aye. Motion carried.

VARIANCE 2-13: Motion by Loomis to approve Variance 2-13, second by Wicks. This Variance will allow Silver Lake Colony to place signs closer than set back regulations. Voting aye: Loomis, Wicks and Hass. Voting nay: Reints, Bjerke. Motion defeated as two-thirds vote of total membership needed for motion to pass. Possible concern was a traffic hazard Sect 4.04.01 (1b) and items in section 3.04.02 relating to variances are on file with said variance application V2-13. 
ADJOURN: Motion by Loomis, second by Reints to adjourn from Board of Adjustment and return to Board of County Commissioners. All voting aye. Motion carried.

ADJOURN: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke to adjourn until next regular meeting April 16, 2013 at 8:00 a.m. All ayes. Motion carried.

ATTEST   (SEAL)

____________________________



___________________________

Christine Tarbox





Francis Hass, Chairman

Clark County Auditor





Clark County Commissioners
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