
CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS
July 2, 2013

The Clark County Commissioners met in regular session on July 2, 2013 in the Commissioners’ meeting room of the Clark County Courthouse.  Chairman Hass called the meeting to order at 8:00 a.m. with the following Commissioners present: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks and Loomis. Also present Auditor Tarbox, States Attorney Fjelland.

MINUTES: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis, to approve the minutes from the June 18, 2013 regular meeting. All members voting aye.  Motion carried.
HIGHWAY: HS Eggleston met with the board to discuss highway conditions and informed the board of damage to the Willow Lake highway shop following the storm on June 21, 2013. 
SURPLUS: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke, to declare 1979 Ford Truck Serial no: K70QVED 0566 and 1979 Chevy truck Serial No C18CY9V 157244 as surplus as they are no longer useful for the purpose which they were purchased. They will be sold at Bells auction in September. All members voting aye. Motion carried. 

SURPLUS: Motion by Reints, second by Hass to declare one sander surplus as it is no longer useful for the purpose which it was purchased. All voting aye. Motion carried.
WAGE: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to add an additional pay scale of $13.00 to the highway part time salary schedule. Highway superintendent will determine pay scale for part time employees. Motion carried with all members voting aye.
STP MEETING: HS Eggleston reminded the commissioners of the upcoming public meeting in Aberdeen on July 16, 2013 sponsored by the South Dakota Department of Transportation to reveal the 2014-2017 Four year Statewide Transportation Improvement Program (STIP).

HIGHWAY: Motion by Wicks, second by Reints to allow proceeds from motorgrader sale from Iron Planet go to highway revenues and be used to pay against the bank note of $265,000 that was established earlier this year. All members voting aye. Motion carried.

HIGHWAY: Robert Linneman met with the board regarding update on the box culvert in Garfield township that needs to be replaced. HS Eggleston will get engineering costs for the replacement and report back to the board. 

CLEANUP: HS Eggleston informed the board he plans to utilize highway crew to help town of Vienna on July 3, 2013 to clean up trees and debris from the June storm. The state is also sending assistance for the cleanup.
FUEL QUOTES: The following quotes were presented to the Board. Diesel #2: Clark Community Oil- $3.12, Bradley, Garden City, Vienna and Willow Lake Shops. Raymond shop no bid. Clark County Farmers Elevator 3.23, Bradley, Garden City, Vienna and Willow Lake shops. Raymond shop no bid.  Wegman Oil 3.15 Raymond shop only. Gasoline: Clark Community Oil 3.15 Clark Shop. Clark County Farmers Elevator-no bid. Wegman Oil - no bid. The County accepted the low bids and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.

FUEL QUOTE: The following quotes were presented to the board for transport load diesel #2. Clark Community Oil- 3.03, Wegman Oil- no bid. Clark Farmers Elevator 3.055. The County accepted the low bid and all bids are on file in the Auditor's office.
TAX DEED PROPERTY: Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to set August 20 at 10:00 a.m. as date for tax deed sale. The sale will be held at the front door of the Clark County Courthouse at 200 N Commercial St in the City of Clark, South Dakota. All voting aye. Motion carried.  

BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to move into Board of Adjustment. All members voting aye. Motion carried.

Hass absent.

VARIANCE 12-13: Vice President Reints presiding. Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to approve Variance 12-13 which will allow Francis Hass to use SE 1/4 9-116-59 to place a shed closer to the township road than zoning setbacks permit. Voting aye: Bjerke, Reints, Wicks and Loomis. Motion carried.

Hass present.

ADJOURN: Motion by Bjerke, second by Reints to adjourn from Board of Adjustment and return to Board of County Commissioners. Motion carried with all voting aye.

 INDUSTRIAL PARK ROAD: Les Solberg with the Clark Development Board met with the board to inform them of information he supplied to First District for the grant application for County Road #7 west of the Industrial Park.

STORM  DAMAGE: Marty Bertsch with Clark County FSA met with the board to discuss damage to area crops, structures and businesses from the storm of June 21, 2013. Mr. Bertsch will obtain more information and report back to the commissioners on July 23, 2013 at which time disaster declaration will be determined.

CONCERNED CITIZEN: Deb Waples and Ashley Waples met with the board regarding time frame of mowing ditches, farming in the right of way, load limits and no trucks on County Road #29, east of Garden City.  The commissioners offered information regarding dates when mowing can be done and the process of reporting farming in the right of way. No action taken.

PLAT: Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to approve the Maag Addition plat. All voting aye. Motion carried.

                                                RESOLUTION 20-13
BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Clark County, South Dakota that the plat entitled "Maag Addition located in Government Lots 1 and 2 and the South half of the Northeast Quarter all in Section 3, Township 118 North, Range 56 West of the 5th P.M., in the County of Clark, South Dakota", which has been submitted for examination pursuant to law, and it appearing that all taxes and special assessments have been paid and that such plat and the survey thereof have been made and executed according to law, the plat is hereby approved, and the County Auditor is hereby authorized and directed to endorse on such plat a copy of this Resolution and certify the same.
Dated this 2nd day of July, 2013
                                                                                         /s/ Francis Hass
                                                                                          Chairman, Board of County Commissioners
                                                                                          Clark County SD
ATTEST:
/s/ Christine Tarbox
County Auditor, Clark County, SD

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke, to allow Chairman to sign third quarter SLA agreement presented by Emergency Manager Gravning. All voting aye. Motion carried.

MITIGATION MEETING: EM Gravning also reminded the Commissioners of final mitigation meetings that are scheduled for July 15, 2013. Committee meeting at 4:00 p.m. and the public meeting at 7:00 p.m. at the Courthouse basement.

BUDGET REQUEST: Motion by Reints, second by Bjerke to approve $10,000 for Clark County Conservation District’s proposed budget for calendar year 2014. The original request from the Conservation District was $12,450.00 All members voting aye. Motion carried.

WEB SITE/ITC INFORMATION: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis to investigate the ITC web camera. Information was presented regarding fees to set up the ITC live feed camera. Cost of the camera is between $4000 to 12,000, depending on quality of equipment chosen, initial set up fees would be $500.00, monthly recurring charges including administration to launch/end meetings as they occurred would run $500/month. The ITC service area would include Bradley, both town and rural, Crocker, Raymond, town only, Clark town only, Willow Lake, town only. Motion by Wicks to amend motion second by Loomis, to explore the Web site option through South Dakota Association of County Officials rather than use ITC. Voting aye for the amendment: Bjerke, Wicks, Loomis. Nay: Hass, Reints. Amendment passes. Motion by Wicks, second by Hass to table this motion, to get clarification of costs of set up and maintenance for the webs site, until next meeting July 23, 2013. All members voting aye. Motion carried. Clarification of costs of set up and maintenance for the web site will be obtained.

AUTO SUPPLEMENT: Motion by Loomis, second by Bjerke, to allow auto supplement for airport funds received from airport grant proceeds from 2012 airport project. Total amount to supplement will be 36912.86. All voting aye. Motion carried.

AIRPORT: Motion by Loomis, second by Hass to approve authorization to advertise for bids for GE terminal and SRE building for 2013 Airport project. Motion carried with all members voting aye.

AIPORT: Motion by Bjerke, second by Loomis to authorize Chairman to sign grant application paperwork for 2013 airport project. All voting aye. Motion carried.
AIPORT: Commissioners were informed Clark County received notification from the US Dept of Transportation, Federal Aviation Administration that the 2013 Clark County Airport Snow Removal Equipment Tractor and Design and Construction of a General Aviation Terminal/Snow Removal Equipment has been reviewed by the National Environmental Policy Act and has been cleared environmentally only. 
CLAIMS:  Motion by Reints, second by Loomis to approve the following claims and authorize auditor to issue payment for same. All members voting aye. Motion carried. GENERAL: Watertown Fire Dept-60%of run 757.32, COMMISSIONERS: Clark Co Courier-proceedings 272.47, AUDITOR: AT&T Mobility-service 12.88, Connecting Point-support contract/upgrade 3773.50, ITC-service 32.71, West Payment Center- SD Law /court rules 259.00, TREASURER: Connecting Point-support contract 2241.00, ITC-services 47.35, QUILL CORP-supplies/paper 87.73, US Merchant Systems-mini mag reader 103.00, STATES ATTORNEY: ITC-service 61.93, West Payment Center- online library 676.37, COURT: Bratland Law-court appointed atty-932.40, SDACO-qtr assessment CLERP 1099.37, PUBLIC BUILDINGS: Atco International-power patch 112.50, Culligan-water 31.00, ITC-services 30.80, Star Laundry& Dry Cleaners-rugs 48.12, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: A&B Business-markers 11.49, Connecting Point support contract 3241.00, ITC-services- 124.18,  West Payment Center- SD Court rules-123.00, REGISTER OF DEEDS: A&B Business –copy machine rent 118.81, Andrea Helkenn-ins reimbursement-312.50, ITC-services 31.46, VETERANS OFFICER: ITC-services 31.13, SHERIFF: AT&T Mobility-service 81.07, Dacotah Ins- 2 notary bonds 100.00, ITC-service 165.49, Tony’s Collission-2 tires/alignment 333.38, AIRPORT: ITC-services 30.89, J&J Earthworks –hangar taxilane extension 36,804.88, Westcoast Sales & Marketing supplies 267.26, POOR: ITC-service .36, Northwestern Energy-co resident assistance 100.00, NURSE: Andrea Helkenn-937.50, AMBULANCE: A-Ox Welding-oxygen/cylinder rent- 97.03, AT&T Mobility-service 38.64, ITC-service 109.64, Unemployment -2nd quarter unemployment 197.20, MENTAL & HANDICAPPED: SD Dept of Revenue-patient care 60.00,  MENTAL HEALTH: Human Service agency -2nd quarter appropriations-3114.26, MEMORIAL DAY: Clark Am Legion-decorate graves-450.10, Larry F Hartman American Legion-decorates graves 175.62, Raymond American Legion-decorate graves-48.94, Thompson Madsen Post #153-decorate graves 71.02, Willow Lake American Legion-decorate graves 254.32, EXTENSION: ITC-service 130.26, Star Laundry- rugs 27.76, Toshiba Financial Services-copy machine rent 163.60, WEED: AT&T Mobility-service 62.62, Clark Comm Oil-gas 3345.00, ITC-services 88.18, Mac's Inc-supplies 191.26, Office Peeps-ink cartridges 34.63, Unemployment Ins Div-second quarter unemployment 295.80, Westside Implement- parts 480.65, PLANNING & ZONING: Clark Co Courier-Hass variance 10.03, ROAD & BRIDGE: Asphalt Paving & materials-cold mix 5846.40, AT&T Mobility-service 108.69, Bound Tree Medical-transport unit 53.92, Butler Corp-parts for P-39 305.68, Dacotah bank-motorgrader payment 95680.00, Diesel Machinery parts 130.55, FJ McLaughlin-hot/cold mix 16561.63, Glacial Lakes Radiator-parts-832.50, Harry's Septic & Sewer Service - clean sewer 329.60,  ITC-services 112.88, Loretta Larson-pit royalty 3278.80, Northwestern Energy-utilities 32.17, SD Dept of Transportation- SIB Loan final payment 18215.38, Schuneman Equipment-rental tractor 3000.00, Sioux City Foundry-cutting edges 6240.00, Sioux Rural Water System -water 29.00, Titan Access Account-parts 288.72, Transport express-trucking fee for loader 1100.00, Unemployment Ins Div-2nd qtr unemployment 493.01, Westside Implement-parts 534.06, Winwater-fabric 3478.20, CIVIL DEFENSE: AT&T Mobility-services 244.41, Neopost -equipment rental 83.85, M&P Relief Flow Thru -SD Ass of Co Officials-Fee-ROD modernization 208.00, TOTAL: 220027.86.

PAYROLL:  COMMISSIONERS: 6785.29 AUDITOR: 3168.53, TREASURER: 2983.92, STATES ATTORNEY: 2446.60, COURTHOUSE: 1506.21, DIRECTOR OF EQUALIZATION: 3106.70, REGISTER OF DEEDS: 2175.40, VETERAN OFFICER: 336.41, SHERIFF: 4548.90, POOR: 453.40, NURSE: 1499.99, AMBULANCE 7649.14, EXTENSION: 1268.27, WEED: 6532.32, PLANNING & ZONING: 396.94, ROAD & BRIDGE: 32490.36, EMERGENCY/DISASTER 843.19, TOTAL: 78191.57.
Overtime by department: HIGHWAY: Richard Mills 18.00, Chance Burke-23.54, Harry Horst 15.00, James Lewandowski 73.50, Doug Loomis 133.47, Greg Stormo – 96.45, Dennis Herman 133.47, Stan Mohr-137.34  WEED: Loren Orris 36.00, Paul Orris 133.47, Greg Stormo- 77.16.
ADJOURN: Motion by Wicks, second by Loomis, to adjourn until next regular meeting July 23, 2013 at 8:00 a.m. All ayes. Motion carried.

ATTEST   (SEAL)

____________________________



___________________________

Christine Tarbox





Francis Hass, Chairman

Clark County Auditor
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